
summer 2020114 gbdmagazine.com

PRACTICE PRACTICE

summer 2020gb&d 115

PUNCH LISTPUNCH LIST

gb&d

The real 
misconception 
in the market 
is that the 
government is 
phasing out all 
R-22, not just virgin 
production and 
importation. The 
EPA’s ban does 
not restrict the 
continued use, 
buying, or selling 
of R-22 refrigerant. 
In reality reclaimed 
R-22 will most 
likely sustain the 
market for 30 or 

more years as these 
systems continue 
to be operated and 
maintained. But 
R-22 demand will 
naturally decline as 
systems reach their 
end of life. As those 
systems are taken 
out of service, their 
refrigerant will 
be reclaimed by a 
certified reclaimer, 
such as Hudson, 
and put back into 
the pool to help 
support and service 
R-22 systems that 

still exist. 
At Hudson 

Technologies, we 
test, process, then 
repackage R-22 into 
cylinders to resell. 
The refrigerant 
goes back into the 
product stream 
to maintain the 
equipment that’s 
still in use. What 
we and most 
chiller, light, 
commercial, 
and industrial 
equipment 
manufacturers 
would say is that 
R-22 remains the 
best refrigerant 
to operate R-22 
designed systems. 
It’s the least 
expensive, most 
energy-efficient, 
optimal way to use 
the refrigerant that 
the system was 
designed for.

A lot of building 
owners see their 
R-22 refrigerant 
and systems as a 
liability or cost, 
but we would 
encourage people 

to see it as a 
valuable asset. 

If a chiller has 
reached its end of 
life and needs to be 
replaced, Hudson 
buys the refrigerant 
at market value 
so clients can 
offset any upgrade 
or replacement 
projects.

Continuing to 
buy and use R-22 
is neither unsafe 
or against the law. 
We call it “the R-22 
rumor” that you 
have to replace 
your system now 
because it’s illegal. 
Many people take 
what is in part true: 
The EPA did phase 
R-22 out, but they 
phased only R-22 
production, not 
general use. 
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As the largest refrigerant reclaimer in North 

America, Hudson Technologies has reclaimed 

millions of pounds of R-22 refrigerant. In 2010 

the EPA started phasing out the virgin produc-

tion and importation of R-22 refrigerant, as R-22 

depletes the ozone if released to the atmo-

sphere. Even though the EPA stopped virgin 

R-22 manufacturing and importation in 2019, this 

doesn’t mean we can’t find a safe way to use it if 

it’s properly maintained. As one of the top three 

most popular refrigerants in North America, R-22 

can easily and safely be recovered and reclaimed 

to the same grade as virgin refrigerant, says Hud-

son Technologies’ Kate Houghton. She recently 

told us more. 

Ask the 
Expert

What do I 
need to know 

about R22?

Kate Houghton, 

Vice President of Sales  

and Marketing, 

Hudson Technologies Company
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Hudson Technologies 
says R-22 is the best 
refrigerant to operate 
R-22 designed 
systems, as it’s the 
least expensive and 
most energy-efficient 
option. The company 
tests, processes, and 
repackages R-22 into 
cylinders to resell.

Read more from 
Hudson Technologies 
when the company 
explores the 
environmental 
benefits of reclaimed 
refrigerants in the Fall 
issue of gb&d. 


